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Division of countries into neo-in-
dustrial and resource existing in the 
world virtually divides them into 
the first and second rate countries. 
It is also known that their tran-
sition from a lower category to a 
higher one is practically impossible. 
At the same time, though, Ukraine 
still has outdated, but developed 
infrastructure which can serve as a 
foundation for neo-industrial leap. 
Herein the major part of Ukrainian 
industry is organized in the form 
of large-scale industrial complexes. 
Thus, the researches in the field of 
development of managerial impact 
on neo-industrial reformation of 
large-scale industrial complexes are 
vital.

Many Ukrainian scholars exam-
ining the problem of enterprises 
development and neo-industrializa-
tion devoted their numerous scien-
tific works to the issue of analysis 
of approaches to enterprises func-
tioning in the neo-industrialized 
form of economics. However, cur-
rently the problem is far from its 
solution. One of the reasons of this 
is poor problem setting, lack of re-
searches defining and structuring 
the typical directions of develop-
ment of large-scale industrial com-
plexes in the conditions of neo-in-

dustrialization taking into account 
Ukrainian peculiarities and stating 
the most important long-term di-
rections in research sphere.

We found out that the weak points 
of all the examined approaches not 
allowing drawing conclusion about 
the existence of uniform solution 
of the problem of neo-industrial de-
velopment of large-scale industrial 
complexes are the following:
•	specifics	 of	 Ukrainian	 large-

scale industrial complexes are ig-
nored or insufficiently revealed in 
most of approaches;
•	top-down	approach	orientation	

in which the main subject of man-
agement of neo-industrial develop-
ment of industrial complexes is the 
state;
•	disregard	 of	 the	 fact	 that	 the	

majority of large-scale industrial 
complexes in Ukraine being in pri-
vate ownership, compete with each 
other and focus first of all not on 
the development but on the highest 
profit in short-term period;
•	underdeveloped	 methods	 of	

definition and evaluation of key in-
dices, characterizing the enterprise 
neo-industrialization level, and 
the lack of formalized approaches 
to formation of the strategy for 
achievement of such indices;
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•	lack	 of	 practical	 investigation	
of the issue of information support 
of large-scale industrial complex-
es in the course of neo-industrial 
development despite the fact that 
straggling of Ukrainian enterpris-
es from the developed countries in 
this field is the strongest one;

Thus, there is a necessity in work-
ing out the conception and mech-
anism of strategic development of 

large-scale industrial complexes 
in conditions of neo-industrializa-
tion, which will allow coordinat-
ing typical purposes of Ukrainian 
industrial complexes with tasks of 
neo-industrial development, taking 
into account specifics of Ukrainian 
industrial complexes and provide 
achievement of the key indices in-
herent in industrial enterprises of 
developed neo-industrial countries.


